ORDINANCE NO. 3316

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
FULLERTON, CALIFORNIA, AMENDING FULLERTON MUNICIPAL
CODE TITLE 14 TO ADOPT THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
BUILDING CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS, INCLUDING
APPENDICES |, J, P; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
RESIDENTIAL CODE WITH LOCAL AMENDMENTS, INCLUDING
APPENDICES AH, AX, AZ; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
ELECTRICAL CODE; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
PLUMBING CODE; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA ENERGY
CODE; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA HISTORICAL
BUILDING CODE; THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA EXISTING
BUILDING CODE AND THE 2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA
GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.5 and 17958.7 authorize
local jurisdictions to make reasonably necessary changes or modifications to the
provisions of the California Building Standards Code (Title 24, California Code of
Regulations) upon finding these changes reasonably necessary due to local conditions.

WHEREAS, City Council finds that adoption of the building standards in the California
Building Standards Code with local amendments set forth below will promote the health,
safety and welfare of Fullerton residents, visitors and businesses.

WHEREAS, Government Code Section 50022.2 authorizes local agencies to adopt
secondary codes such as the California Building Code, in whole or in part.

WHEREAS, all legal prerequisites prior to the adoption of this Ordinance have occurred.

NOW, THEREFORE, THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULLERTON ORDAINS
AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1.  City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code, Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction) ,Chapter 14.03 (Building Code) in its entirety and replaces
as follows,:

CHAPTER 14.03 BUILDING CODE

Sections:

14.03.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Building Code.

14.03.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.

14.03.030 Amendment to Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.
14.03.040 Amendment to Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit.
14.03.050 Amendment to Section 105.5 Expiration.



Ordinance No. 3316

Page 2

14.03.060 Addition of Section 105.8 Responsibility of permittee.
14.03.070  Addition of Subsections 109.2.1 and 109.2.2 to Section 109.
14.03.080 Amendment to Section 113.1 General.

14.03.090 Addition of Subsections 903.2.8.1.1 and 903.2.8.1.2 to Section 903.2.8.
14.03.100 Amendment to Table 1505.1.

14.03.110 Amendment to Section 1505.1.2.

14.03.120 Amendment to Section 1612.3.

14.03.130 Amendment to Section 1807.1.6.

14.03.140 Amendment to Section 3109.2.

14.03.150 Addition of Section J101.3 Protection of utilities.

14.03.160 Addition of Section J101.4 Protection of adjacent property.
14.03.170  Addition of Section J101.5 Storm water control measures.
14.03.180 Amendment to Section J103.1.

14.03.190 Amendment to Section J103.2.

14.03.200 Addition of Subsection J104.2.1 to Section J104.2
14.03.210  Addition of Section J109.5.

14.03.220 Amendment to Section J110.1.

14.03.230  Addition of Section J112 to Appendix J.

14.03.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Building Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, Volumes 1 & 2, and everything
contained therein, including Appendices |, J and P thereto, codified as Part 2 of Title 24
of the California Code of Regulations, California Building Standards Code, is hereby
adopted by reference, in accordance with Section 50022.2 of the Government Code,
except those Sections that are adopted as amended in this Chapter. A copy of the 2022
Edition of the California Building Code, is on file in the office of the Fullerton Building
and Safety Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section number
contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, not amended by this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For example, “Section
102" of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, shall be deemed to be
“Subdivision 102 of Section 14.03.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may be
referred to as, “Section 102 of the Fullerton Building Code.”

14.03.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.
Section 101.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fullerton Building Code,
hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

14.03.030 Amendment to Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.
Section 103.1 of Chapter 1, Division |i of the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 3

103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The City of Fullerton Building Division is
hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Building and
Safety Manager. The function of the division shall be the implementation,
administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

All references to “building official” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California
Building Codes, shall be deemed to refer to the Building and Safety Manager.

14.03.040 Amendment to Section 105.2 Work exempt from permit.
Section 105.2 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of this code
shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in
violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

Building:

1. One-story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds,
playhouses and similar uses, provided that the floor area does not exceed 120
square feet (11 m2). It is permissible that these structures still be regulated by
Section 710A, despite exemption from permit.

2. Masonry or concrete fences not over 3 feet (1066.8 mm) in height above lowest
adjacent grade, and all other fences not over 6 feet (1,828.8 mm) in height above
lowest adjacent grade.

Oil derricks.

4. Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or
impounding Class I, Il or IHlA liquids.

5. Water tanks supported directly on grade if the capacity is not greater than 5,000
gallons (18 925 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width is not greater than
2:1.

6. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches (762 mm) above adjacent
grade, and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an
accessible route.

7. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish
work.

8. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery.

9. Prefabricated swimming pools accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy that are less
than 24 inches (610 mm) deep, are not greater than 5,000 gallons (18 925 L) and
are installed entirely above ground.

10.Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes, not
including service systems.

w



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 4

11.Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one- and two-

family dwellings.

12.Window awnings in Group R-3 and U occupancies, supported by an exterior wall

that do not project more than 54 inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do
not require additional support.

13.Nonfixed and movable fixtures, cases, racks, counters and partitions not over 5

feet 9 inches (1753 mm) in height.

Electrical:

Gas:
. Portable heating appliance.

Repairs and maintenance: Minor repair work, including the replacement of
lamps or the connection of approved portable electrical equipment to approved
permanently installed receptacles.

Radio and television transmitting stations: The provisions of this code shall
not apply to electrical equipment used for radio and television transmissions, but
do apply to equipment and wiring for a power supply and the installations of
towers and antennas.

Temporary testing systems: A permit shall not be required for the installation of
any temporary system required for the testing or servicing of electrical equipment
or apparatus.

Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or
make such equipment unsafe.

Mechanical:

1.

o o

Portable heating appliance.

2. Portable ventilation equipment.
3.
4. Steam, hot or chilled water piping within any heating or cooling equipment

Portable cooling unit.

regulated by this code.
Replacement of any part that does not alter its approval or make it unsafe.
Portable evaporative cooler.

Self-contained refrigeration system containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less of
refrigerant and actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (0.75 kW) or less.

Plumbing:

1.

The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe, provided,
however, that if any concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe
becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same
with new material, such work shall be considered as new work and a permit shall
be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 5

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures and
the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not
involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

14.03.050 Amendment to Section 105.5 Expiration.
Section 105.5 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the site
authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after its issuance, or if the
work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period of
180 days after the time the work is commenced. The building official is authorized to
grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days
each. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Time limitation for permit expiration as the result of code enforcement shall be as per
notice of violation or as otherwise determined by the Building Official.

14.03.060 Addition of Section 105.8 Responsibility of permittee.
Section 105.8 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, is hereby added to read as follows:

105.8 Responsibility of permittee. Building permits shall be presumed by the city to
incorporate all of the work that the applicant, the applicant's agent, employees and/or
contractors shall carry out. Said proposed work shall be in accordance with the
approved plans and with all requirements of this code and any other laws or regulations
applicable thereto. No city approval shall relieve or exonerate any person from the
responsibility of complying with the provisions of this code nor shall any vested rights be
created for any work performed in violation of this code.

14.03.070  Addition of Subsections 109.2.1 and 109.2.2 to Section 109.
Section 109 of Chapter 1, Division |l of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code,
is hereby amended by adding the following subsections:

109.2.1 Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data is required to be submitted by
Section 107.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and
specifications for review. The plan review fee shall be as set forth in the Fee Schedule
set by the Community and Economic Development Department.

Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, or when
the project involves deferred submittal items as defined in Section 107.3.4.1, an
additional plan review fee shall be charged at a rate established by the Fee Schedule.

109.2.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of final approval of plans shall expire, and plans and other
data submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 6

the Building Official. The Building Official may extend the time for action by the applicant
for a period not exceeding 180 days upon request by the applicant showing that
circumstances beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from being
taken. No application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew action on an
application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan
review fee.

14.03.080 Amendment to Section 113.1 General.
Section 113.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Building
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 113.1 Appeals. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this Code
and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of this
Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.

14.03.090 Addition of Subsections 903.2.8.1.1 and 903.2.8.1.2 to Section
903.2.8.

Section 903.2.8 of Chapter 9 of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended by adding the following subsections:

903.2.8.1.1 Existing Group R buildings. An automatic residential fire sprinkler system
shall be installed when alterations to an existing building within any two-year period
removes floor area or roof area assemblies of more than 50 percent of the existing
building.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for
additions or alterations to existing buildings that are not already provided with an
automatic residential sprinkler system and that do not include alterations within
any two-year period involving the removal of floor area or roof area assemblies of
more than 50 percent of the total existing floor area of the building.

903.2.8.1.2 Existing Group R buildings in Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas. An
automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed when alterations to an
existing building within any two-year period removes floor area or roof area assemblies
of more than 33 percent of the existing building.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for
additions or alterations to existing buildings that are not already provided with an
automatic residential sprinkler system and that do not include alterations within
any two-year period involving the removal of floor area or roof area assemblies of
more than 33 percent of the total existing floor area of the building.

14.03.100 Amendment to Table 1505.1.
Table 1505.1 of Chapter 15 of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:



Ordinance No. 3316

Page 7
TABLE 1505.12
MINIMUM ROOF COVERING CLASSIFICATION FOR TYPES OF
CONSTRUCTION
1A B mA B mA mB v vA |vB |
B B B B B B B B |B

For SI: 1 foot = 304.8 mm, 1 square foot = 0.929 m2
a. Unless otherwise required in accordance with Chapter 7A.

14.03.110 Amendment to Section 1505.1.2.
Section 1505.1.2 of Chapter 15 of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

1505.1.2 Roof coverings within all other areas. The entire roof covering of every
existing structure where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is replaced within
any one-year period, the entire roof covering of every new structure, and any roof
covering applied in the alteration, repair or replacement of the roof of every existing
structure, shall be a fire-retardant roof covering that is at least Class B.

14.03.120 Amendment to Section 1612.3.
Section 1612.3 of Chapter 16 of the 2022 Edition of the Califoia Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the
applicable governing authority shall adopt a flood hazard map and supporting data. The
flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of special flood hazard as
identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering report
entitled “The Flood Insurance Study for Orange County, California and Incorporated
Areas,” dated March 21, 2019, as amended or revised with the accompanying Flood
Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood Boundary and Floodway Map (FBFM) and
related supporting data along with any revisions thereto. The adopted flood hazard map
and supporting data are hereby adopted by reference and declared to be part of this
section.

14.03.130 Amendment to Section 1807.1.6.
Section 1807.1.6 of Chapter 18 of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls. [OSHPD
1R, 2 & 5]. Not permitted by OSHPD. Concrete and masonry foundation walls that are
laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be permitted to be designed and
constructed in accordance with this section. Prescriptive design of foundation walls
shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

14.03.140 Amendment to Section 3109.2



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 8

Section 3109.2 of Chapter 31 of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

3109.2 California swimming pool safety act (statewide). When a building permit is
issued for the construction of a new swimming pool or spa or the remodeling of an
existing swimming pool or spa at a private single-family home, the respective swimming
pool or spa shall have the drowning prevention safety features as required by the
amended 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code Appendix AX.

14.03.150 Addition of Section J101.3 Protection of utilities.
Section J101.3 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby added to read as follows:

J101.3 Protection of utilities. The owner and permittee of any property on which
grading has been performed and that requires a grading permit under Section J103
shall be responsible for the prevention of damage to any public utilities or services.

If such damage occurs the owner and/or permittee shall be responsible to restore
damaged facilities/improvements to pre-existing or better conditions.

14.03.160 Addition of Section J101.4 Protection of adjacent property.
Section J101.4 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby added to read as follows:

J101.4 Protection of adjacent property. The owner and permittee of any property on
which grading has been performed and that requires a grading permit under Section
J103 is responsible for the prevention of damage to adjacent property and no person
shall excavate on land sufficiently close to the property line to endanger any adjoining
public street, sidewalk, alley, or other public or private property without supporting and
protecting such property from settling, cracking or other damage that might result.
Special precautions approved by the building official shall be made to prevent imported
or exported materials from being deposited on the adjacent public way and/or drainage
courses.

14.03.170 Addition of Section J101.5 Storm water control measures.
Section J101.5 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby added to read as follows:

J101.5 Storm water control measures. The owner and permittee of any property on
which grading has been performed and that requires a grading permit under Section
J103 shall put into effect and maintain all precautionary measures necessary to protect
adjacent water courses and public or private property from damage by erosion, flooding,
and deposition of mud, debris and construction-related pollutants originating from the
site during, and after, grading and related construction activities. Furthermore, the
owner and permittee shall be responsible for putting into effect and maintaining
appropriate measures necessary to prevent any change in cross-lot surface drainage



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 9

that may adversely affect any adjoining property as a result of grading and/or
construction-related activities. Such measures to prevent any adverse cross-lot surface
drainage effects on adjoining property shall be required whether shown on approved
grading plans or not. No increase of storm water runoff and/or intensity will be permitted
in the cross-lot surface drainage application.

14.03.180 Amendment to Section J103.1.
Section J103.1 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

J103.1 Permits required. Except as exempted in Section J103.2, no grading shall be
performed without first having obtained a permit therefor from the City Engineer or
Building Official. A grading permit shall be required for all grading operations resulting
in the alteration of the existing storm water flow pattern. A grading permit does not
include the construction of retaining walls and other structures.

14.03.190 Amendment to Section J103.2
Section J103.2 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

J103.2 Exemptions. A grading permit shall not be required for the following:

1. Grading in an isolated, self-contained area, provided there is no danger to the
public and that such grading will not adversely affect adjoining properties.

2. Excavation for construction of a structure permitted under this code where the
excavation is limited to within the volume of the proposed structure, except
when the structure is located on a hillside site. For the purposes of this
exemption, a hillside site is one where the existing grade is twenty percent or
greater; and which may be adversely affected by drainage and/or stability
conditions within or from outside the site, or which may cause an adverse
effect on the adjacent property.

Cemetery graves.
Refuse disposal sites controlled by other regulations.
Excavations for wells, or trenches for utilities.

Mining, quarrying, excavating, processing or stockpiling rock, sand, gravel,
aggregate or clay controlled by other regulations, provided such operations
do not affect the lateral support of, or significantly increase stresses in, soil on
adjoining properties.

7. Exploratory excavations performed under the direction of a registered design
professional. Exploratory excavations must not create a hazardous condition
to adjacent properties or the public and must be restored to existing
conditions.

8. An excavation that does not exceed 50 cubic yards of soil (38.3 m?®) and
complies with one of the following conditions:

a. is less than 2 feet (0.6 m) in depth.

o0 kW



Ordinance No. 3316

Page 10

b.

does not create a cut slope greater than 5 feet (1.5 m) measured
vertically upward from the cut surface to the surface of the natural
grade and is not steeper than 2 units horizontal to 1 unit vertical (50
percent slope).

9. A fill not intended to support a structure, that does not obstruct a drainage
course and complies with one of the following conditions:

a.

is less than 1 foot (0.3 m) in depth and is placed on natural terrain with
a slope flatter than 5 units horizontal to 1 unit vertical (20 percent
slope).

is less than 3 feet (0.9 m) in depth at its deepest point measured
vertically upward from natural grade to the surface of the fill, does not
exceed 50 cubic yards, and creates a fill slope no steeper than 2 units
horizontal to 1 unit vertical (50 percent slope).

is less than 5 feet (1.5 m) in depth at its deepest point measured
vertically upward from natural grade to the surface of the fill, does not
exceed 20 cubic yards, and creates a fill slope no steeper than 2 units
horizontal to 1 unit vertical (50 percent slope).

Figure J103.2

Exemption from the permit requirements of this appendix shall not be deemed to grant
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of this
code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction.

EXCAVATIONS FILLS
-NOT INTENDED TO SUPPORT STRUCTURES
- DO NOT OBSTRUCT A DRAINAGE COURSE
FILL PLACED ON R
AN EXCAVATION o o v —
R
MEREY | wmeewe— || —— T
THAN 2 FT IN g —_ K
DEPTH AND —— T H<2FT 'E,isEiTHAN il o %5 NATURAL GRADE
DOES NOT - « i
EXCEED S0CY |~ 7
=50CY FILL LESS THAN ssocy
3ET DEEP ATITS | i‘! —
DEEPEST POINT 22 —
vaTpoesNoT | OFT 4 [2 - -
EXCEED 50CY "V\_
AN EXCAVATION - NATURAL GRADE
WHICH CREATES . —
ACUT SLOPE NATURAL GRADE T
NOT GREATER _?5.. - T 200y
THAN SFT IN - = H2BFT FILL LESS THAN =
HEIGHT. NOT - £ [/ l SFT DEER AT ITS l — —
S_TEEPERD‘(;”E';" e DEEPESTPOINT | D<&FT = » —
&1 4D S0 cy THAT DOES NOT - K
e = EXCEED/20CY == NATURAL GRADE
50CY -
14.03.200 Addition of Subsection J104.2.1 to Section J104.2

Section J104.2 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended by adding the following subsection:

J104.2.1 Grading plan requirements.

In addition to the requirements of Section

J104.2, an application for a grading permit shall be accompanied by plans that include,
but shall not be limited to, the following information:



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 11

General vicinity of the proposed site.
Soils report stamped and signed by a licensed geotechnical engineer
Limits and depths of cut and fill with earthwork quantities calculations.

N =

Location of any buildings or structures where work is to be performed, and the
location of any buildings or structures within 15 feet (4.6 m) of the proposed
grading.

5. Contours, cross-sections, flow areas, elevations, or slopes which define
existing and proposed drainage patterns.

6. Storm water control measures.

7. Storm water quality control measures and Best Management Practices (BMP)
when applicable.

8. Pre- and post-construction hydrology and hydraulics report when applicable.

9. Location of existing and proposed utilities, drainage facilities, and recorded
public and private easements and use restricted use areas.

10.Location of all Special Flood Hazard Areas.

11.Contour and drainage on adjacent properties if the project is a part of a tract
and/or a larger area drainage system.

14.03.210 Addition of Section J109.5.
Section J109.5 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby added to read as follows:

J109.5 Storm water control measures. An application for a grading permit shall show
details of such temporary and permanent de-silting catch basins, drainage, surfacing,
slope planting, and other erosion, surface water, and flood control protective devices,
installations, and measures to be installed upon such property as are reasonably
necessary, based upon the time of year during which the work will be commenced and
completed, and upon the maximum rainfall intensity expected under conditions of a 25-
year frequency storm, to prevent any damage to any public or private property from any
land movement, erosion, surface water, or flooding, or from any deposit, or washing
away of any soil, mud silt, rocks, sand or other earth material or debris, by, in, or from,
the doing of such work, or which may originate, or come, from the site of such work.
Such plans are required to show that all of such protective devices, installations and
measures will comply with the Fullerton Building Code.

14.03.220 Amendment to Section J110.1.
Section J110.1 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

J110.1 General. All fill and cut slopes which are determined by the Building Official to
be subject to erosion shall be planted and irrigated with an irrigation system to promote



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 12

the growth of ground cover plants to protect the slopes against erosion, as required in
this section. The owner shall be responsible for planting and maintaining all slopes
where such is required in this section. The protection for the slopes shall be installed as
soon as practical and prior to calling for final approval. A landscaping and irrigation plan
shall be submitted for approval with the grading plan.

14.03.230 Addition of Section J112 to Appendix J.
Section J112 of Appendix J of the 2022 Edition of the California Building Code, is
hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION J112
GRADING PERMIT ISSUANCE

J112.1 General. The provisions of Section J104 are applicable to grading permits. No
person shall do or cause or permit to be done, on any property under such person'’s
control, any grading work between the first day of October of any year and the 15th day
of April of the following year unless there shall have been first provided on the property
to be graded all of the temporary or permanent protective devices, installations, and
measures required to be shown on the plans for such work by Section 105, with the
exception of such grading work as may be necessary to provide said protection. No
person in control of any such required protection shall fail to maintain it in such a
condition that it will continue to serve its purpose in the same manner as, or better than,
when it was installed. No person shall remove, damage or destroy, or cause or permit to
be removed, damaged or destroyed, except for repair, improvement or replacement,
any such required protection without a written permit from the Building Official certifying
that such protection is no longer reasonably needed.

J112.2 Performance Bond. A grading permit shall not be issued for work which, if not
completed in accordance with the approved plans and specifications, is likely to result in
a hazardous condition, unless the permittee shall first file with the Building Official an
agreement in writing executed by the applicant together with a performance bond in an
amount sufficient to cover the cost of storm protection devices and corrective work
necessary to remove and eliminate all hazards.

J112.3 Liability Bond. Where the work referred to in Section J112.2, above, may
expose adjacent private or public property to damage or cause injuries or death to
others, the agreement and performance bond shall be accompanied by a certificate of
insurance, verifying Comprehensive General Liability Policy with minimum combined
single limits of $500,000 per occurrence or insured's current limits, whichever is greater.
The City of Fullerton shall be endorsed as an additional insured on the policy and said
policy shall not be materially changed or terminated without a minimum of thirty (30)
days' notice in writing to the City.

J112.4 Cash Deposit. Where the grading permit approves the export of excess
material away from the site of grading, or approves the import of material to the site, the
Permittee, in addition to compliance with Sections J113.2 and J113.3, above, shall, prior



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 13

to grading permit issuance, obtain in written form from the Director of Public Works, a
permit for such export or import, which permit shall:

1. Set standards and criteria for the hours of operation, routes to be taken, and
traffic control, detour, and safety measures to be undertaken during the
export or import operations;

2. Require the Permittee to clean up and remove all spillage or deposits of dirt,
mud, silt, or other materials or debris resulting from the grading and export or
import;

3. Require as a guarantee of said cleanup and repair of any City right-of-way
improvement damaged during grading or hauling, the deposit of a cash
bond, in an amount equal to $500 or 5% of the valuation of the export and/or
import yardage. The amount required for this bond may be adjusted as
deemed necessary by the Director of Community Economic Development or
the Director of Engineering. All or any part of said amount may be used by
the City to clean up or repair City streets and easements should the
Permittee fail to do as required above. This cash deposit, less any City
expenses and costs, shall be returned to the Permittee upon satisfactory
completion of the grading work described on the grading permit, together
with the City's release of any bonds or securities held therefor.

J112.5 Form. Such agreement performance bond, liability bond or certificate of
insurance, and export / import permit and cash bond shall be in a form, and executed in
a manner, approved by the City Attorney before acceptance thereof by the Building
Official.

J112.6 Review. Review all proposed grading shall be reviewed by the Director of
Community and Economic Development, Planning Commission, and/or City Council, as
applicable for conformance with the intent and specific requirements of this Section.
Unless specifically waived by the Planning Commission or City Council because of
specific physical constraints or unaesthetic results, failure to suitably conform to the
intent or requirements of this Section shall be cause for denial of the proposed grading
or of the proposed project of which the proposed grading is a part. Notwithstanding any
other provision of this Chapter, any such denial by the Director of Community and
Economic Development is appealable to the Planning Commission, and any such
decision of the Planning Commission is appealable to the City Council. The decision of
the City Council shall be final and shall make reference to Sections 1094.5 and 1094.6
of the California Code of Civil Procedure.

J112.7 Contoured Grading.

J112.7.1 Definition.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 14

Contour or landform grading utilizes variable slopes designed to simulate the
appearance of and blend into the surrounding natural terrain.

J112.7.2 Purpose. The purpose of this Section is to preserve the natural terrain,
quality, environment and aesthetic character of the City, while encouraging creative
innovative and safe residential development with a variety of housing types. This
section applies to hillside grading where the City desires that new grading and
construction blend into the existing hillside environment.

J112.7.3 Design Objectives. In hillside areas characterized by steep topography and
wildlife habitat, slopes shall be landform graded. Said landform grading shall utilize
individually designed, creative and innovative techniques to as nearly as possible
simulate natural landforms, including variable horizontal and vertical slope ratios,
contour grading, planter pockets, “swale” and “knob” landforms, extensively rounded
“corners”, “blending” with the natural terrain where applicable, undulating (both vertically
and horizontally) terraces where applicable, and camouflaged down drains. Innovative
land planning, such as single-loaded streets with split level or “upside down” housing is
also encouraged.

Section2. City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.04 (Residential Code) in its entirety and

replaces as follows, effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.04 RESIDENTIAL CODE

Sections:

14.04.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Residential Code.

14.04.020 Amendment to Section R101.1 Title.

14.04.030 Amendment to Section R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.
14.04.040 Addition of Subsection R102.7.2 to Section R102.7.

14.04.050 Amendment to Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit.
14.04.060 Amendment to Section R105.5 Expiration.

14.04.070  Addition of Section R105.10 Responsibility of permittee.
14.04.080 Addition of Subsections R108.2.1 and R108.2.2 to Section R108.
14.04.090 Amendment to Section R112.1.

14.04.100 Amendment to Table R301.2.

14.04.110 Amendment to Section R313.2.

14.04.120 Amendment to Section R902.1.

14.04.130 Amendment to Section R902.1.2.

14.04.140 Amendment to Section R902.4,

14.04.150 Amendment to Section 115922(a).

14.04.160 Amendment to Section 115923.

14.04.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Residential Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, and everything contained therein,
including Appendices AH, AX and AZ, codified as Part 2.5 of Title 24 of the California



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 15

Code of Regulations, California Building Standards Code, is hereby adopted by
reference, in accordance with Section 50022.2 of the Government Code, except those
Sections that are adopted as amended in this Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the
California Residential Code, is on file in the office of the Fullerton Building and Safety
Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section number
contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, not amended by this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For example, “Section
R102” of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, shall be deemed to be
“Subdivision R102 of Section 14.04.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may be
referred to as, “Section 102 of the Fullerton Residential Code.”

14.04.020 Amendment to Section R101.1 Title.
Section R101.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

R101.1 Title. These provisions shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and
Two-family Dwellings of The City of Fullerton, and shall be cited as such and will be
referred to herein as “this code”.

14.04.030 Amendment to Section R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.
Section R103.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

R103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The City of Fullerton Building Division is
hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Building and
Safety Manager. The function of the division shall be the implementation,
administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

All references to “building official” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California
Residential Code, shall be deemed to refer to the Building and Safety Manager.

14.04.040 Addition of Subsection R102.7.2 to Section R102.7.
Section R102.7 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended by adding the following subsection:

R102.7.2 Standards for approval of existing unpermitted structures, used for
human habitation. The codes in effect when the structure was built may be applied, if
that date can be determined, and a finding can be made that a level of safety equivalent
to the current code is provided. However, nothing in this section shall preclude the
Building Official applying the current codes to insure an adequate level of safety. For
habitable structures or limited second dwelling units, specific upgrades and
requirements are noted, but not limited to those shown below. Nothing in this section



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 16

will eliminate or modify the requirements for compliance with any other part of the
Fullerton Municipal Code.

Zoning:

The proposed use of the structure must be in compliance with Fullerton Municipal Code
Title 15, Zoning.

Electrical:

Ground fault and arc fault protection of outlets will be required. Smoke and carbon
monoxide detectors will be required. All electrical wiring and distribution must be
installed with recognized materials and in compliance with the codes in effect at the time
the structure was built, or in compliance with current codes.

Plumbing:

A legal connection to a sanitary sewer system must be provided. A water closet and
sink must be provided. A source of hot water must be provided. All fuel burning
appliances must be properly installed and vented. All plumbing must be installed with
recognized materials and in compliance with the codes in effect at the time the structure
was built, or in compliance with current codes.

Mechanical:

A code-compliant source of heat must be provided, which can be controlled by the
tenant. The heat source must be able to maintain 68 degrees throughout the dwelling 3
feet above the floor. All fuel burning appliances must be installed and vented in
compliance with any applicable code. All mechanical equipment must be installed with
recognized materials and in compliance with the codes in effect at the time the structure
was built, or in compliance with current codes.

Egress:

Each sleeping room shall have at least one window or door that meets current egress
requirements. Light and ventilation shall meet the current requirements. Structural
adequacy must be verified.

Energy:

New lights or equipment must be installed in accordance with current standards. If the
walls or ceilings are opened, insulation shall be installed in accordance with current
codes unless precluded by structural conditions, then the appropriate thickness of
insulation shall be provided that will fit in the wall or ceiling.

14.04.050 Amendment to Section R105.2 Work exempt from permit.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 17

Section R105.2 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Exemptions from permit requirements of this code
shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in
violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this
jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following:

Building:

1.

Other than storm shelters, one-story detached accessory structures, provided
that the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet (11.15 m?). It is permissible
that these structures still be regulated by Section 710A, despite exemption from
permit.

Masonry or concrete fences not over 3 feet (1066.8 mm) in height above lowest
adjacent grade, and all other fences not over 6 feet (1,828.8 mm) in height above
lowest adjacent grade.

Retaining walls that are not over 4 feet (1219 mm) in height measured from the
bottom of the footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge.

Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000
gallons (18 927 L) and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2
to 1.

Sidewalks and driveways.

. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish

work.
Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches (610 mm) deep.

. Swings and other playground equipment.

Window awnings supported by an exterior wall that do not project more than 54
inches (1372 mm) from the exterior wall and do not require additional support.

10. Decks not exceeding 200 square feet (18.58 m?) in area, that are not more than

30 inches (762 mm) above grade at any point, are not attached to a dwelling and
do not serve the exit door required by Section R311.4.

Electrical:

1.
2.
3.

Listed cord-and-plug connected temporary decorative lighting.
Reinstallation of attachment plug receptacles but not the outlets therefor.

Replacement of branch circuit overcurrent devices of the required capacity in the
same location.

Electrical wiring, devices, appliances, apparatus or equipment operating at less
than 25 volts and not capable of supplying more than 50 watts of energy.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 18

5. Minor repair work, including the replacement of lamps or the connection of
approved portable electrical equipment to approved permanently installed
receptacles.

Gas:
1. Portable heating, cooking or clothes drying appliances.

2. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or
make such equipment unsafe.

3. Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and
are not interconnected to a power grid.

Mechanical:

1. Portable heating appliances.
Portable ventilation appliances.
Portable cooling units.

LN

Steam, hot- or chilled-water piping within any heating or cooling equipment
regulated by this code.

5. Replacement of any minor part that does not alter approval of equipment or
make such equipment unsafe.

6. Portable evaporative coolers.

7. Self-contained refrigeration systems containing 10 pounds (4.54 kg) or less of
refrigerant or that are actuated by motors of 1 horsepower (746 W) or less.

8. Portable-fuel-cell appliances that are not connected to a fixed piping system and
are not interconnected to a power grid.

Plumbing:

1. The stopping of leaks in drains, water, soil, waste or vent pipe; provided,
however, that if any concealed trap, drainpipe, water, soil, waste or vent pipe
becomes defective and it becomes necessary to remove and replace the same
with new material, such work shall be considered as new work and a permit shall
be obtained and inspection made as provided in this code.

2. The clearing of stoppages or the repairing of leaks in pipes, valves or fixtures,
and the removal and reinstallation of water closets, provided such repairs do not
involve or require the replacement or rearrangement of valves, pipes or fixtures.

14.04.060 Amendment to Section R105.5 Expiration.
Section R105.5 of Chapter 1, Division |l of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued shall become invalid unless the work on the
site authorized by such permit is commenced within 12 months after its issuance, or if
the work authorized on the site by such permit is suspended or abandoned for a period



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 19

of 180 days after the time the work is commenced. The building official is authorized to
grant, in writing, one or more extensions of time, for periods not more than 180 days
each. The extension shall be requested in writing and justifiable cause demonstrated.

Time limitation for permit expiration as the result of code enforcement shall be as per
notice of violation or as otherwise determined by the Building Official.

14.04.070 Addition of Section R105.10 Responsibility of permittee.
Section R105.10 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California
Residential Code, is hereby added to read as follows:

R105.10 Responsibility of permittee. Building permits shall be presumed by the city to
incorporate all of the work that the applicant, the applicant's agent, employees and/or
contractors shall carry out. Said proposed work shall be in accordance with the
approved plans and with all requirements of this code and any other laws or regulations
applicable thereto. No city approval shall relieve or exonerate any person from the
responsibility of complying with the provisions of this code nor shall any vested rights be
created for any work performed in violation of this code.

14.04.080 Addition of Subsections R108.2.1 and R108.2.2 to Section R108.
Section R108 of Chapter 1, Division |l of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended by adding the following subsections:

R108.2.1 Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data is required to be submitted by
Section R106.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and
specifications for review. The plan review fee shall be as set forth in the Fee Schedule
set by the Community and Economic Development Department.

Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, or when
the project involves deferred submittal items as defined in Section 107.3.4.1 of the 2022
Edition of the California Building Code, an additional plan review fee shall be charged at
a rate established by the Fee Schedule.

R108.2.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of final approval of plans shall expire, and plans and other
data submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by
the Building Official. The Building Official may extend the time for action by the applicant
for a period not exceeding 180 days upon request by the applicant showing that
circumstances beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from being
taken. No application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew action on an
application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan
review fee.

14.04.090 Amendment to Section R112.1.
Section R112.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 20

Section R112.1 Appeals. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this Code
and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of this
Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.

14.04.100

Amendment to Table R301.2

Table R301.2 of Chapter 3 of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

TABLE R301.2
CLIMATIC AND GEOGRAPHIC DESIGN CRITERA

GROUND WIND DESIGN SEISMIC SUBKECT TO DAMAGE FROM ICE BARRIER . AR MEAN
SNOW Speci i DESIGN UNDERLAYMENT FREEZING | ANNUAL
i pecial Windborne " g i .
LOAD® | Speed" T°pf‘;9'f$h’° wind debris CATEGORY' | \yeathering® F?S‘t:']’;e Termite® REQUIRED" | HAZARDS® | \pexi | TEMPI
(mph) efiects reqion! zong™ _ep |
- . See Exhibit |
0 106 NO NO NO D;orE Negligible 12in. Very Heavy NO B 0 60
MANUAL J DESIGN CRITERIA"
. Altitude correction . Indoor winter design Ingor wir?ter design dry- | Outdoor winter design dry-bulb Heating temperature
Sigxation factor® | Coincident wet bulb dry-bulb temperature bulb temperature temperature difference
305 69 70 39 31
Latitude Daily range Indoor summer design Indoor summer design indoor summer design Outdoor summer design dry-bulb Cooling temperature
¥ rang relative humidity relative humidity | dry-bulb temperature temperature difference
34 27 | 75 85 10

For SI: 1 pound per square foot = 0.0479 kPa, 1 mile per hour = 0.447 m/s.

a.

Where weathering requires a higher strength concrete or grade of masonry than necessary to satisfy the structural
requirements of this code, the frost line depth strength required for wreathing shall govern. The weathering column shall
be filled in with the weathering index, “negligible”, “moderate” or “severe” for concrete as determined from Figure
R301.2(1). The grade of masonry units shall be determined from ASTM C34, ASTM C55, ASTM C62, ASTM C73, ASTM
€90, ASTM C129, ASTM C145, ASTM C216 or ASTM C652.

Where the frost line depth requires deeper footings than indicated in Figure R403.1(1), the frost line depth strength
required for weathering shall govern. The jurisdiction shall fill in the frost line depth column with the minimum depth of
footing below finish grade.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table to indicate the need for protection depending on whether there has been a
history of local subterranean termite damage.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map [Figure R301.2(2)].
Wind exposure category shall be determined on a site-specific basis in accordance with Section R301.2.1.4.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this section of the table to establish the design criteria using Table 10A from ACCA Manual J or
established criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the seismic design category determined from Section R301.2.2.1.

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with: the date of the jurisdiction’s entry into the National Flood Insurance
Program (date of adoption of the first code or ordinance for management of fiood hazard areas); and the title and date of
the currently effective Flood Insurance Study or other flood hazard study and maps adopted by the authority having
jurisdiction, as amended.

In accordance with Sections R905.1.2, R205.4.3.1, R905.5.3.1, R905.6.3.1, R905.7.3.1 and R905.8.3.1, where there has
been a history of local damage from the effects of ice damming, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES.”
Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “NO.”

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the 100-year return period air freezing index (BF-days) from Figure
R403.3(2) or from the 100-year (99 percent) value on the National Climatic Data Center data table “Air Freezing Index-
USA Method (Base 32°F)."

The jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with the mean annual temperature from the National Climatic Data Center
data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F)."



Ordinance No. 3316

Page 21

k. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.5, where there is local historical data documenting structural damage to buildings
due to topographic wind speed-up effects, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES.” Otherwise, the
jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

. In accordance with Figure R301.2(2), where there is local historical data documenting unusual wind conditions, the
jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table with “YES" and identify any specific requirements. Otherwise, the jurisdiction

shall

indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

m. In accordance with Section R301.2.1.2 the jurisdiction shall indicate the wind-borne debris wind zone(s). Otherwise, the
jurisdiction shall indicate “NO” in this part of the table.

n. The jurisdiction shall fill in these sections of the table to establish the design criteria using Table 1a or 1b from ACCA
Manual J or established criteria determined by the jurisdiction.

0. Thej

14.04.110
Section R

urisdiction shall fill in this section of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in Figure R301.2(3) and R301.2(4).

Amendment to Section R313.2.
313.2 of Chapter 3 of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, is

hereby amended to read as follows:

R313.2 One- and two-family dwellings automatic fire sprinkler systems. An

automatic
dwellings.

residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed in one- and two-family

Exceptions:

1.

4.

14.04.120

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required when
alterations to an existing building within any two-year period removes floor
area or roof area assemblies of less than 50 percent of the existing building.

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required when
alterations to an existing building within any two-year period removes floor
area or roof area assemblies of less than 33 percent of the existing building
for existing buildings within Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas.

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not be required for
additions to existing buildings that are not already provided with an automatic
residential sprinkler system and that do not include alterations within any two-
year period involving the removal of floor area or roof area assemblies of
more than 50% of the total existing floor area of the building.

Accessory Dwelling Unit, provided that all of the following are met:

4.1. The unit meets the definition of an Accessory Dwelling Unit as
defined in the Government Code Section 65852.2.

4.2. The existing primary residence does not have automatic fire
sprinklers.

4.3. The accessory detached dwelling does not exceed 1,200 square
feet in size.

4.4. The unit is on the same lot as the primary residence.

Amendment to Section R902.1.

Section R902.1 of Chapter 9 of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 22

R902.1 Roofing covering materials. Roofs shall be covered with materials as set forth
in Sections R804 and R905. A minimum Class A or B roofing shall be installed in areas
designated by this section or where the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet (914 mm)
from a lot line. Class A or B roofing required by this section to be listed shall be tested in
accordance with UL 790 or ASTM E108.

Exceptions:

1. Class A roof assemblies include those with coverings of brick, masonry
and exposed concrete roof deck.

2. Class A roof assemblies include ferrous or copper shingles or sheets,
metal sheets and shingles, clay or concrete roof tile, or slate installed on
noncombustible decks.

3. Class A roof assemblies include minimum 16 ounces per square foot
copper sheets installed over combustible decks.

4. Class A roof assemblies include slate installed over underlayment over
combustible decks.

14.04.130 Amendment to Section R902.1.2.
Section R902.1.2 of Chapter 9 of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

R902.1.2 Roof coverings in all other areas. The entire roof covering of every existing
structure where more than 50 percent of the total roof area is replaced within any one-
year period, the entire roof covering of every new structure, and any roof covering
applied in the alteration, repair or replacement of the roof of every existing structure,
shall be a fire-retardant roof covering that is at least Class B.

14.04.140 Amendment to Section R902.4.
Section R902.4 of Chapter 9 of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code, is
hereby amended to read as follows:

R902.4 Rooftop-mounted photovoltaic (PV) panel systems. Rooftop-mounted
photovoltaic (PV) panel systems installed on or above the roof covering shall be tested,
listed and identified with a fire classification in accordance with UL 2703. Listed
systems shall be installed in accordance with the manufacturer’s installation instructions
and their listing. Class A or B photovoltaic panels and modules shall be installed areas
designated by this section, in jurisdictions designated by law as requiring their use, or
where the edge of the roof is less than 3 feet (914 mm) from a lot line.

14.04.150 Amendment to Section 115922(a).
Section 115922(a) of Appendix AX of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:



Ordinance No. 3316

Page 23

115922.
(a) Excep

t as provided in Section 115925, when a building permit is issued for the

construction of a new swimming pool or spa or the remodeling of an existing swimming
pool or spa at a private single-family home, the respective swimming pool or spa shall
be equipped with item #1 below and at least one additional of the following seven
drowning prevention features:

1.

14.04.160

An enclosure that meets the requirements of 115923 and isolates the
swimming pool and spa from the private single-family home. Any walls of the
residential structure or accessory structures used to complete the isolation
enclosure must have door openings equipped with protection as required in
115922 (a) #4 or #5. Any such door protection device provided for this
purpose may not be used to comply with the second drowning prevention
feature requirement.

Removable mesh fencing that meets American Society for Testing and
Materials (ASTM) Specifications F2286 standards in conjunction with a gate
that is self-closing and self-latching and can accommodate a key lockable
device.

An approved safety pool cover, as defined in subdivision (d) of Section
115921.

Exit alarms on the private single-family home’s doors that provide direct
access to the swimming pool or spa. The exit alarm may cause either an
alarm noise or a verbal warning, such as a repeating notification that “the
door to the pool is open.”

A self-closing, self-latching device with a release mechanism placed no lower
than 54 inches (1372 mm) above the floor on the private single-family home's
doors providing direct access to the swimming pool or spa.

An alarm that, when placed in a swimming pool or spa will sound upon
detection of accidental or unauthorized entrance into the water. The alarm
shall meet and be independently certified to the ASTM Standard F2208
“Standard Safety Specification for Residential Pool Alarms,” which includes
surface motion, pressure, sonar, laser and infrared type alarms. A swimming
protection alarm feature designed for individual use, including an alarm
attached to a child that sounds when the child exceeds a certain distance or
becomes submerged in water, is not a qualifying drowning prevention feature.

Other means of protection, if the degree of protection afforded is equal to or
greater than that afforded by any of the features set forth above and has been
independently verified by an approved testing laboratory as meeting
standards for those features established by the ASTM or the American
Society of Mechanical Engineers (ASME).

Amendment to Section 115923.



Ordinance No. 3316

Page 24

Section 115923 of Appendix AX of the 2022 Edition of the California Residential Code,
is hereby amended to read as follows:

115923
An enclos

1.

ure shall have all of the following characteristics:

Any access gates through the enclosure open away from the swimming pool
and are self-closing with a self-latching device placed no lower than 60 inches
(1524 mm) above the ground.

A minimum height of 60 inches (1524 mm).

A maximum vertical clearance from the ground to the bottom of the enclosure
of 2 inches (51 mm).

Gaps or voids, if any, do not allow passage of a sphere equal to or greater
than 4 inches (102 mm) in diameter.

An outside surface free of protrusions, cavities or other physical
characteristics that would serve as handholds or footholds that could enable a
child below the age of five years to climb over.

Where the barrier is composed of diagonal members, such as a lattice or
chain link fence, the maximum opening formed by the diagonal members
shall be no more than 2-1/4 inches. Posts shall be spaced at not over eight
feet on center. The bottom wire of a chain link fence shall be staked to the
ground, between support posts, unless provided with a bottom rail or pipe.

Access gates shall have a width no greater than four feet. Gates shall be self-
closing and self-latching and swing in the direction of exit from the pool area.
The latching device shall be capable of keeping the gate securely latched at
all times when not in use.

The barrier shall be so arranged and constructed so that no impediment to a
required exit is created, and a minimum of a three-foot-wide walking path is
maintained between the barrier and the water.

All swimming pool and spa water shall be maintained in a clear condition
which is free of significant algae, insects, debris and in a sanitary condition.
The entire floor of the pool shall be clearly visible.

Section 3. City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and

Construction), Chapter 14.05 (Electrical Code) its entirety and replaces as
follows, effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.05 ELECTRICAL CODE

Sections:

14.05.010
14.05.020
14.05.030

Adoption of the 2022 California Electrical Code.
Title.
Addition of Subsection 89.108.4.1.1 to Section 89.108.4.1.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 25

14.05.040 Amendment to Section 89.108.4.2.
14.05.050 Addition of Subsection 89.108.4.3.2 to Section 89.108.4.3.
14.05.060 Amendment to Section 89.108.8.1.

14.05.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Electrical Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, and everything contained therein,
codified as Part 3 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California Building
Standards Code, based on the 2020 National Electrical Code as published by the
National Fire Protection Association, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance
with Section 50022.2 of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted
as amended in this Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical
Code, is on file in the office of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical
Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section number
contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, not amended by this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For example, “Section
89.101.1" of the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, shall be deemed to be
“Subdivision 89.101.1 of Section 14.05.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may
be referred to as, “Section 89.101.1 of the Fullerton Electrical Code.”

14.05.020 Title.
This Chapter and the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, as adopted by this
Chapter, shall be known as the Fullerton Electrical Code.

14.05.030 Addition of Subsection 89.108.4.1.1 to Section 89.108.4.1.
Section 89.108.4.1 the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, is hereby
amended to add subsection 89.108.4.1.1 as follows:

Section 89.108.4.1.1. Requirements for Permit. The application for an electrical
permit shall be in writing on forms furnished by the Community and Economic
Development Department and shall be filled out in full stating the location by street and
number of the building, or place where the work is to be performed, the name and
address of the owner, the name and address of the person who will do the work, and a
statement that such person has a State Contractor's License when such work is for
occupancies other than R-3 or U. Applications shall contain or be accompanied by a
plan, when required by the Fee Schedule, showing the entire amount of work
contemplated, the character of such work, and a diagram of wiring showing all outlets,
meter locations, load centers, conduit and wire sizes, the length of runs and circuits,
and, as nearly as possible, the manner in which all wire and other electrical connections
and equipment are to be installed, together with all other information required by the
Building Official. All plans submitted requiring a connected load of 400 or greater
amperes, or 600 volts to ground, or greater, shall be prepared by an Electrical Engineer
registered by the State of California and each sheet shall bear his registration number,
date of expiration and signature.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 26

14.05.040 Amendment to Section 89.108.4.2.
Section 89.108.4.2 the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Section 89.108.4.2. Permit Fees. The applicant shall pay for each permit at the time of
issuance, a fee as set forth in the Fee Schedule as adopted by the City Council. The
City Council, by resolution, shall set the amount of fees to be required by the Fullerton
Electrical Code and may, from time to time, adjust the fee amounts. Whenever Table
No. 3-A is referenced in this Code, it shall mean the Fee Schedule as adopted by the
City Council.

14.05.050 Addition of Subsection 89.108.4.3.2 to Section 89.108.4.3.
Section 89.108.4.3 the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, is hereby
amended to add subsection 89.108.4.3.2 as follows:

Section 89.108.4.3.2. Plan Check Fees. When plans are required as set forth in this
code, the applicant shall pay the plan check fee as set forth in the Fee Schedule at the
time of submittal for the plan check.

14.05.060 Amendment to Section 89.108.8.1.
Section 89.108.8.1 of the 2022 Edition of the California Electrical Code, is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Section 89.108.8.1. General. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this
Code and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of
this Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.

Section 4:  City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.06 (Green Building Standards Code) in its entirety and
replaces as follows, effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.06 GREEN BUILDING STANDARDS CODE

Sections:

14.06.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code.
14.06.020 Title.

14.06.030 Addition of Section 107.

14.06.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Green Building Standards Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code, and everything
contained therein, codified as Part 11 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations,
California Building Standards Code, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance with
Section 50022.2 of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted as
amended in this Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code, is on file in the office of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 27

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Green
Building Standards Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or
section number contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Green Building
Standards Code, not amended by this Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of
this Chapter. For example, “Section 102.1” of the 2022 Edition of the California Green
Building Standards Code, shall be deemed to be “Subdivision 102.1 of Section
14.06.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may be referred to as, “Section 102.1
of the Fullerton Green Building Standards Code.”

14.06.020 Title.

This Chapter and 2022 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code, as
adopted by this Chapter, shall be known as the Fullerton Green Building Standards
Code.

14.06.030 Addition of Section 107.
Section 107 of the 2022 Edition of the California Green Building Standards Code, is
hereby added to read as follows:

SECTION 107
APPEALS

Section 107.1. General. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this Code
and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of this
Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.

Section 5.  City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.07 (Plumbing Code) in its entirety and replaces
as follows, effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.07 PLUMBING CODE

Sections:

14.07.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Plumbing Code.
14.07.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.

14.07.030 Amendment to Section 104.3.2.

14.07.040 Amendment to Section 104.5.

14.07.050 Amendment to Section 107.1.

14.07.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Plumbing Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, and everything contained therein,
codified as Part 5 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California Building
Standards Code, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance with Section 50022.2
of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted as amended in this
Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, is on file in the
office of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 28

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing
Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section number
contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, not amended by this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For example, “Section
102.0” of the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing Code, shall be deemed to be
“Subdivision 102.0 of Section 14.07.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may be
referred to as, “Section 102.0 of the Fullerton Plumbing Code.”

14.07.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.
Section 101.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. This document shall be known as the “Fulierton Plumbing Code”, may be
cited as such, and will be referred to herein as “this code.”

14.07.030 Amendment to Section 104.3.2.
Section 104.3.2 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104.3.2 Plan Review Fees. The City Council, by resolution, shall set the
amount of fees to be required for the issuance of permits required by the Fullerton
Plumbing Code, and shall adjust said fees annually based upon data provided by the
Community and Economic Development Department. Prior to issuance of a plumbing
permit, the fees shall be paid. Whenever Table 104.5 is referenced in this Code, it shall
mean the fees adopted by City Council resolution.

14.07.040 Amendment to Section 104.5.
Section 104.5 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104.5 Fees. The applicant shall pay for each permit at the time of issuance, a
fee as set forth in the Fee Schedule as adopted by the City Council. The City Council,
by resolution, shall set the amount of fees to be required by the Fullerton Plumbing
Code and may, from time to time, adjust the fee amounts. Whenever Table 104.5 is
referenced in this Code, it shall mean the Fee Schedule as adopted by the City Council.

14.07.050 Amendment to Section 107.1.
Section 107.1 of Chapter 1, Division |l of the 2022 Edition of the California Plumbing
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 107.1 General. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this Code
and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of this
Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 29

Section 6.  City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.09 (Mechanical Code) in its entirety and
replaces as follows, effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.09 MECHANICAL CODE

Sections:

14.09.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Mechanical Code
14.09.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.

14.09.030 Amendment to Section 104.3.2.

14.09.040 Amendment to Section 104.5.

14.09.050 Amendment to Section 107.1.

14.09.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Mechanical Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, and everything contained therein,
codified as Part 4 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California Building
Standards Code, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance with Section 50022.2
of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted as amended in this
Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, is on file in the
office of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical
Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section number
contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, not amended by this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For example, “Section
207.0” of the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical Code, shall be deemed to be
“Subdivision 207.0 of Section 14.09.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may be
referred to as, “Section 207.0 of the Fullerton Mechanical Code.”

14.09.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.
Section 101.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. This document shall be known as the “Fullerton Mechanical Code”, may
be cited as such, and will be referred to herein as “this code.”

14.09.030 Amendment to Section 104.3.2.
Section 104.3.2 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104.3.2 Plan Review Fees. The City Council, by resolution, shall set the
amount of fees to be required for the issuance of permits required by the Fullerton
Mechanical Code, and shall adjust said fees annually based upon data provided by the
Community and Economic Development Department. Prior to issuance of a mechanical
permit, the fees shall be paid. Whenever Table 104.5 is referenced in this Code, it shall
mean the fees adopted by City Council resolution.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 30

14.09.040 Amendment to Section 104.5.
Section 104.5 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 104.5 Fees. The applicant shall pay for each permit at the time of issuance, a
fee as set forth in the Fee Schedule as adopted by the City Council. The City Council,
by resolution, shall set the amount of fees to be required by the Fullerton Mechanical
Code and may, from time to time, adjust the fee amounts. Whenever Table 104.5 is
referenced in this Code, it shall mean the Fee Schedule as adopted by the City Council.

14.09.050 Amendment to Section 107.1.
Section 107.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Mechanical
Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 107.1 General. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this Code
and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of this
Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.

Section 7.  City Council adopts Fulleton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.10 (Existing Building Code) as follows, effective
January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.10 EXISTING BUILDING CODE

Sections:

14.10.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Existing Building Code.
14.10.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.

14.10.030 Amendment to Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.
14.10.040  Addition of Section 105.8 Responsibility of permittee.
14.10.050 Addition of Subsections 108.2.1 and 108.2.2 to Section 108.
14.10.060 Amendment to Section 112.1.

14.10.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Existing Building Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Existing Building Code, and everything contained
therein, codified as Part 10 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California
Building Standards Code, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance with Section
50022.2 of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted as amended
in this Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Existing Building Code, is on
file in the office of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Existing
Building Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section
number contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Existing Building Code, not
amended by this Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For
example, “Section 102.1” of the 2022 Edition of the California Existing Building Code,



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 31

shall be deemed to be “Subdivision 102.1 of Section 14.10.010 of the Fullerton
Municipal Code,” and may be referred to as, “Section 102.1 of the Fullerton Existing
Building Code.”

14.10.020 Amendment to Section 101.1 Title.
Section 101.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Existing
Building Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fullerton Existing Building Code,
hereinafter referred to as “this code”.

14.10.030 Amendment to Section 103.1 Creation of enforcement agency.
Section 103.1 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the Califomnia Existing
Building Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

103.1 Creation of enforcement agency. The City of Fullerton Building Division is
hereby created and the official in charge thereof shall be known as the Building and
Safety Manager. The function of the division shall be the implementation,
administration and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

All references to “code official” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Existing
Building Code, shall be deemed to refer to the Building and Safety Manager.

14.10.040 Addition of Section 105.8 Responsibility of permittee.
Section 105.8 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Existing
Building Code, is hereby added to read as follows:

105.8 Responsibility of permittee. Building permits shall be presumed by the city to
incorporate all of the work that the applicant, the applicant’s agent, employees and/or
contractors shall carry out. Said proposed work shall be in accordance with the
approved plans and with all requirements of this code and any other laws or regulations
applicable thereto. No city approval shall relieve or exonerate any person from the
responsibility of complying with the provisions of this code nor shall any vested rights be
created for any work performed in violation of this code.

14.10.050 Addition of Subsections 108.2.1 and 108.2.2 to Section 108.
Section 108 of Chapter 1, Division Il of the 2022 Edition of the California Existing
Building Code, is hereby amended by adding the following subsections:

108.2.1 Plan Review Fees. When a plan or other data is required to be submitted by
Section 106.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting plans and
specifications for review. The plan review fee shall be as set forth in the Fee Schedule
set by the Community and Economic Development Department.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 32

Where plans are incomplete or changed so as to require additional plan review, or when
the project involves deferred submittal items as defined in Section 106.3.4, an additional
plan review fee shall be charged at a rate established by the Fee Schedule.

108.2.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of final approval of plans shall expire, and plans and other
data submitted for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by
the Building Official. The Building Official may extend the time for action by the applicant
for a period not exceeding 180 days upon request by the applicant showing that
circumstances beyond the control of the applicant have prevented action from being
taken. No application shall be extended more than once. In order to renew action on an
application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans and pay a new plan
review fee.

14.010.060 Amendment to Section 112.1.
Section 112.1 of Chapter 1, Division |l of the 2022 Edition of the California Existing
Building Code, is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 112.1 Appeals. In order for final interpretation of the provisions of this Code
and to hear appeals provided for hereunder, the procedures of Chapter 14.02 of this
Code shall govern the filing and hearing of such appeals.

Section 8. City Council adopts Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.12 (Historical Building Code) as follows,
effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.12 HISTORICAL BUILDING CODE

Sections:
14.12.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Historical Building Code.

14.12.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Historical Building Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Historical Building Code, and everything contained
therein, codified as Part 8 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California
Building Standards Code, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance with Section
50022.2 of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted as amended
in this Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Historical Building Code, is
on file in the office of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Historical
Building Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section
number contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Historical Building Code, not
amended by this Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For
example, “Section 8-102.1" of the 2022 Edition of the California Historical Building
Code, shall be deemed to be “Subdivision 8-102.1 of Section 14.12.010 of the Fullerton



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 33

Municipal Code,” and may be referred to as, “Section 8-102.1 of the Fullerton Historical
Building Code.”

Section 9.  City Council repeals Fullerton Municipal Code Title 14 (Buildings and
Construction), Chapter 14.16 (California Energy Code) in its entirety and
replaces as follows, effective January 1, 2023:

CHAPTER 14.16 CALIFORNIA ENERGY CODE

Sections:
14.16.010  Adoption of the 2022 California Energy Code.

14.16.010 Adoption of the 2022 California Energy Code.

The 2022 Edition of the California Energy Code, and everything contained therein,
codified as Part 6 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California Building
Standards Code, is hereby adopted by reference, in accordance with Section 50022.2
of the Government Code, except those Sections that are adopted as amended in this
Chapter. A copy of the 2022 Edition of the California Energy Code, is on file in the office
of the Fullerton Building and Safety Manager.

All references to “this Code” contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Energy
Code, shall be deemed to refer to this Chapter. Each paragraph or section number
contained in the 2022 Edition of the California Energy Code, not amended by this
Chapter, shall be deemed to be a subdivision of this Chapter. For example, “Section
100.1” of the 2022 Edition of the California Energy Code, shall be deemed to be
“Subdivision 100.1 of Section 14.16.010 of the Fullerton Municipal Code,” and may be
referred to as, “Section 100.1 of the Fullerton Energy Code.”

Section 10. References to Prior Code. Unless superseded and expressly repealed,
references in City forms, documents and regulations to the chapters and sections of the
former 2019 Triennial Edition or any prior edition of Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations, California Building Standards Code, shall be construed to apply to the
corresponding provisions contained within the 2022 Triennial Edition of the Title 24 of
the California Code of Regulations, California Building Standards Code.

Section 11. Effective Date, Exceptions. This ordinance becomes effective and shall be
in full force on January 1, 2023; provided, however that where complete plans for
buildings have been filed and are pending for building permits prior to the effective date
of this Ordinance, permits may be issued, and the applicant may proceed with the
construction in strict compliance with the former 2019 Triennial Edition of the Title 24 of
the California Code of Regulations, California Building Standards Code, provided
however physical construction is started within 12 months from the date of issuance of
the permit and continued to completion according to said former 2019 Triennial Edition
of the Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations, California Building Standards
Code.



Ordinance No. 3316
Page 34

Section 12. Inconsistencies. Any provision of the Fullerton Municipal Code or
appendices thereto inconsistent with the provisions of this Ordinance, to the extent of
such inconsistencies and no further, is hereby repealed or modified to that extent
necessary to effect the provisions of this Ordinance.

Section 13. Severability. If any chapter, article, section, subsection, subdivision,
sentence, clause, phrase or portion of this Ordinance, or the application thereof to any
person, is for any reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by the decision of any
court of competent jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portion of this Ordinance or its application to other persons. The City Council
hereby declares that it would have adopted this Ordinance and each chapter, article,
section, subsection, subdivision, sentence, clause, phrase or portion thereof,
irespective of the fact that any one or more subsections, subdivisions, sentences,
clauses, phrases or portions of the application thereof to any person, be declared invalid
or unconstitutional. No portion of this Ordinance shall supersede any local, State, or
Federal law, regulation or codes dealing with life safety factors.

Section 14. The City Clerk shall certify to the passage and adoption of this ordinance

and shall cause the same to be posted in the manner required by law. This ordinance
shall become effective thirty days from and after its passage.

ADOPTED BY THE FULLERTON CITY COUNCIL ON DECEMBER 20, 2022.

- —=

Fred Jung
Mayor

ATTEST:

(

Clerk \



City of Fullerton
ORDINANCE CERTIFICATION

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF ORANGE ) S§S
CITY OF FULLERTON )

ORDINANCE NO. 3316

I, Lucinda Williams, City Clerk and ex-officio Clerk of the City Council of the City of Fullerton, California,
hereby certifies that the whole number of the members of the City Council of the City of Fullerton is five;
and that the above and foregoing Ordinance No. 3316 had first reading by title only, introduction and
further reading waived at the November 15, 2022 City Council regular meeting and was adopted at the
December 20, 2022 City Council regular meeting by the following vote:

COUNCIL MEMBER AYES: Jung, Whitaker, Charles, Dunlap, Zahra
COUNCIL MEMBER NOES: None
COUNCIL MEMBER ABSTAINED: None
COUNCIL MEMBER ABSENT: None
/ -

Lucindg Williams, MMC
City Clerk

V/



Section 1.

ORDINANCE NO. 3317

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF

FULLERTON,

CALIFORNIA, AMENDING FULLERTON

MUNICIPAL CODE TITLE 13, CHAPTER 13.20 TO ADOPT THE
2022 EDITION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE WITH LOCAL
AMENDMENTS

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF FULLERTON ORDAINS AS FOLLOWS:

City Council deletes Fullerton Municipal Code Chapter 13.20,

Fullerton Fire Code of 2019, in its entirety and replaces with the
following:

Chapter 13.20.

SECTIONS:

13.20.10
13.20.20
13.20.30
13.20.40
13.20.50
13.20.60
13.20.70
13.20.80
13.20.90
13.20.100
13.20.110
13.20.120
13.20.130
13.20.140
13.20.150

13.20.160
13.20.170
13.20.180
13.20.190
13.20.200
13.20.210
13.20.220
13.20.230
13.20.240
13.20.250

2022 FULLERTON FIRE CODE

Adoption of the 2022 California Fire Code
General, Amended

Applicability, Amended

Department of Fire Prevention, Amended

Permits, Amended

Fees, Added

Maintenance, Added

Means of Appeals, Amended

Violations, Amended

Stop Work Order, Amended

Validity, Added

Definitions, Added

Vegetation, Amended

Hazardous Conditions, Added

Open Burning, Recreational Fires, and Portable Outdoor
Fireplaces, Added

Christmas Tree Sales, Added

Use of Equipment, Added

Fire Apparatus Access Roads, Amended

Premises |dentification, Amended

Key Boxes, Amended

Fire Protection Water Supplies, Amended
Emergency Responder Radio Coverage, Amended
Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems, Amended
Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings, Amended
Energy Systems, Amended

Page 1



Ordinance No. 3317
Page 2

13.20.260 Defensible Space, Amended

13.20.270  Fuel Modification Requirements in Protected Areas, Added
13.20.280 Explosives and Fireworks General, Added

13.20.290 Fireworks Display, Added

13.20.300 Appendix D, Amended

13.20.10 ADOPTION OF THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE
LOCAL FULLERTON AMENDMENTS

Pursuant to the provisions of Section 50022.1 to 50022.8, inclusive, of the
Government Code of the State of California, the City Council of the City of Fullerton
does hereby adopt, by reference, the 2022 Edition of the California Fire Code,
incorporating by reference the 2021 International Fire Code with California
Amendments, as codified within Part 9, Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations, also known as the California Building Standards Code, as amended
by this Chapter, including Appendix Chapter 4, and Appendices B, BB, C, CC, D,
E,F, G, I K M, Nand O, but specifically excluding Appendices A, H, J, L, and P
as amended, and the whole thereof, save and except such portions as are
hereinafter deleted or amended by this chapter. One copy of this Code has been
and is now filed in the office of the City Clerk of the City of Fullerton and the same
is hereby adopted and incorporated as if fully set out at length herein, and from the
date on which this ordinance shall take effect, which is January 1, 2023, the
provisions thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the City of Fullerton.

13.20.20 SECTION 101 GENERAL
Section 101.1 Title. (Amended)

These regulations shall be known as the 2022 Fullerton Fire Code,
hereinafter referred to in this chapter as “this code.”

13.20.30 SECTION 102 APPLICABILITY
Section 102.10 Conflicting Provisions. (Amended)
Where there is a conflict between a general requirement and a
specific requirement, the fire code official shall decide which
requirement meets the general intent of this code.

13.20.40 SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF FIRE PREVENTION
Section 103.3 Deputies. (Amended)

In accordance with the prescribed procedures of this jurisdiction and
with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the fire code official



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 3

13.20.50

shall have the authority to appoint a deputy fire code official, other
related technical officers, inspectors and other employees. When
requested by the fire code official, the Chief of Police is authorized
to assign such available police officers as necessary to assist the fire
department in enforcing the provisions of this code.

SECTION 105 PERMITS

Section 105.5 Required Operational Permits. (Amended)

The fire code official is authorized to issue operational permits for the
operations set forth in Appendix Chapter 1, Sections 105.5.1 through
105.5.62

Subsection 105.5.6 Cellulose Nitrate Film. (Amended)

An operational permit is required to store, handle or use cellulose
nitrate film.

Subsection 105.5.55 Aircraft Refueling Vehicles. (Added)
A permit is required to operate an aircraft refueling vehicle.
Subsection 105.5.56 Christmas Tree Lot. (Added)

A permit is required to operate a Christmas tree lot in the City of
Fullerton.

Subsection 105.5.57 Fire Clearance, New Business. (Added)

A fire clearance inspection is required to open or to change
ownership of a Fullerton business.

Subsection 105.5.58 Fire Clearance Required by State or Other
Governmental Agencies. (Added)

Classifications:

A. Convalescent, Nursing Homes, Assisted Living
Child Day Care Facilities — less than 26 persons
Child Day Care Facilities — 26 or more persons
Hospitals, less than 100 beds

Hospitals, 100 beds or more

nmmoow

Sanitariums



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 4

13.20.60

G. Schools (private)

H. Residential Care Facilities, less than 26 persons

I. Residential Care Facilities, 26 or more persons

J. Residential Care Facilities, more than 6 non-ambulatory
persons

Subsection 105.5.59 Fireworks Booth (Added)

A permit is required to operate a fireworks booth in the City of
Fullerton.

Subsection 105.5.60 Fireworks Display (Added)

A permit is required to conduct a public or private fireworks display
in the City of Fullerton.

Subsection 105.5.61 General Use. (Added)

A General Use Permit shall be required for any activity or operation
not specifically described in this section, which in the judgment of the
fire code official is likely to produce conditions hazardous to life or
property.

Subsection 105.5.62 Mobile Fueling Operations (Added)

A permit is required to operate mobile fueling operations.

Section 105.6 Required Construction Permits. (Amended)

The fire code official is authorized to issue construction permits for
work as set forth in Sections 105.7.1 through 105.7.25.

Subsection 105.6.25 Misc. Plan Check (Added)

Request or submittal of any type of plan or necessary review of
documents pertaining to operations that are covered by the Fire
Department or this Code but are not specifically listed in Chapter 1.
SECTION 107 FEES

Subsection 107.7 Permit Fees. (Added)

For each and every permit issued pursuant to this code, there shall
be paid to the City of Fullerton Fire Department a fee in such amount



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 5

13.20.70

13.20.80

13.20.90

as established by resolution of the Fullerton City Council. Failure to
pay such fees shall be cause for revocation of the permit.

SECTION 109 MAINTENANCE
Section 109.7 Occupant Count. (Added)

The supervisor of each place of assembly shall have an effective
system to maintain a count of the number of occupants present in
order to keep the number at or below the allowable occupant load. If
the fire code official determines at any time that an accurate count of
occupants is not being maintained, the occupancy shall be cleared
to obtain an accurate count.

SECTION 111 MEANS OF APPEALS
Section 111.1 Board of Appeals Established. (Amended)

In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the fire code official relative to the
application and interpretation of this code, there shall be and is
hereby created a board of appeals. The board of appeals shall be
the planning commission reconvened as the board of appeals. The
board in conducting its business shall follow the appeals procedures
articulated in Chapter 6.01 of the Fullerton Municipal Code. As to
appeals pursuant to this Section, “Director of Community and
Economic Development” shall be replaced by “fire official’
throughout the applicable sections of Chapter 6.01.

Subsection 111.3 Qualifications. (Amended)

The board of appeals noted in section 109.1 shall consult and gather
information from a qualified person(s) with the experience and
training to consult and testify on matters pertaining to hazards of fire,
explosions, hazardous conditions or fire protection systems.

SECTION 112 VIOLATIONS
Section 112.4 Violation Penalties. (Amended)

Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect,
install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor, punishable by a fine of not more than $1000



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 6

13.20.100

13.20.110

13.20.120

dollars or by imprisonment not exceeding 180 days, or both such fine
and imprisonment. Each day that a violation continues after due
notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

SECTION 113 STOP WORK ORDER
Section 113.4 Failure to Comply. (Amended)

Any person who shall continue any work after having been served
with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed
to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be in
violation of this Code and be subject to citations and/or penalties in
amounts as determined by the City Council.

SECTION 115 VALIDITY
Section 115.1 Validity (Added)

The Fullerton City Council hereby declares that should any section,
paragraph, sentence, or word of this chapter or of the California Fire
Code as adopted and amended herein be declared for any reason to
be invalid, it is the intent of the Fullerton City Council that it would
have passed all other portions of this ordinance independent of the
elimination here from of any such portion as may be declared invalid.

Chapter 2, DEFINITIONS
Section 202
“FIRE HAZARD” (Added)

Anything or act which increases or could cause an increase of the
hazard or menace of fire to a greater degree than that customarily
recognized as normal by persons in the public service regularly
engaged in preventing, suppressing or extinguishing fire or anything
or act which could obstruct, delay, hinder or interfere with the
operations of the fire department or the egress of occupants in the
event of fire.

“SPARK ARRESTER’ (Added)

A listed device constructed of noncombustible material specifically for
the purpose of meeting one of the following conditions:



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 7

13.20.130

13.20.140

13.20.150

1. Removing and retaining carbon and other flammable
particles/debris from the exhaust flow of an internal combustion
engine in accordance with California Vehicle Code Section
38366.

2. Fireplaces that burn solid fuel in accordance with California
Building Code Chapter 28.

Section 304 VEGETATION
304.1.2 Vegetation (Amended)

Weeds, grass, vines, or other growth that is capable of being ignited
and endangering property, shall be cut down and removed by the
owner or occupant of the premises. Vegetation clearance
requirement in urban-wildland interface areas shall be in accordance
with Chapter 49. Type, amount, arrangement, and maintenance of
vegetation in a fuel modification area, interior slope, or similarly
hazardous area shall be in accordance with Fullerton Fire
Department Standard- Fullerton Very High Hazard Severity Zone
Requirements- Technical Design for New Construction Fuel
Modification Plans and Maintenance Program.

Section 305 HAZARDOUS CONDITIONS
Section 305.6 Hazardous Conditions (Added)

305.6 Hazardous conditions. Outdoor fires burning wood or other
solid fuel are not allowed when any of the following conditions applies:

1. When predicted sustained winds exceed 8 MPH and relative
humidity is less than 25%, or a red flag condition has been
declared

2. When an official sign was caused to be posted by the fire code
official, or a public announcement is made

No outdoor fires using any fuel type are permitted when predicted
sustained winds exceed 20 MPH or when such fires present a hazard
as determined by the fire code official.

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES, AND
PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 8

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES, FIRE
PITS, FIRE RINGS, AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES
(Amended)

Subsection 307.6 (Added)

307.6 Outdoor Fires in the Fuel Modification Areas. Outdoor,
open or recreational fires using wood or other solid fuel shall not be
built, ignited or maintained in the fuel modification area.

Exception:

1. Occupied one and two-family dwellings where such fires are
built in a permanent or portable barbeque, gas outdoor
fireplace, fire pits, fire rings, or gas grill and are a minimum of
30 feet (9144mm) from a grass, grain, brush, or forest-
covered area. Permanent barbecues, portable barbecues,
outdoor fireplaces or grills shall not be used for the disposal
of rubbish, trash, or combustible waste material.

2. Fires at official organized campsites or parks when located in
permanent or portable barbecue or grill, incinerator, or
outdoor fireplace (all equipped with some type of spark
arrester) located at least 30 feet from combustible vegetation.

Subsection 307.6.1 (Added)
307.6.1 Outdoor fires. Outdoor, open burning and recreational
fires shall not be built, ignited or maintained when the following

conditions exist:

1. Predicted sustained winds exceed 8 MPH at the ground
level, or a red flag condition has been declared.

2. A person age 18 or over is not present at all times to watch
and tend such fire.

3. A public announcement is made that open burning is
prohibited.

4. A viable water source or approved means of
extinguishment is not Immediately available.

Exception:



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 9

13.20.160

1. Occupied one and two-family dwellings where such fires are
built in a permanent or portable barbeque, outdoor fireplace,
or grill and are a minimum of 15 feet (9144mm) from any
combustible material or structure. Permanent barbecues,
portable barbecues, outdoor fireplaces or grills shall not be
used for the disposal of rubbish, trash, or combustible waste
material.

2. Fires at official organized campsites or parks when located in
permanent or portable barbecue or grill, incinerator, or
outdoor fireplace (all equipped with some type of spark
arrester) located at least 30 feet from combustible vegetation.

SECTION 324 CHRISTMAS TREE SALES

Section 324.1 Christmas Tree Sales. (Added)

No person shall sell, display for sale, or store for sale in the City of
Fullerton, any cut Christmas tree, unless a permit therefore has been
obtained from the Fire Department.

Subsection 324.1.1 Permit — When issued. (Added)

Permits to sell, display for sale, or store for sale cut Christmas trees
in the City of Fullerton may only be issued for the period from
November 5 to December 31. The applicant must show that the
proposed location and method of any activity will not constitute a fire
hazard or violation of law.

Subsection 324.1.2 Cleanup Deposit. (Added)

Each applicant shall make a cleanup guarantee deposit of $1,000.00
with the City of Fullerton. The applicant must agree that not later
than the tenth day of January following the issuance of such permit,
all unsold trees, combustible waste and accumulation of sawdust will
be removed from the permitted location and disposed of properly.
Following the tenth day of January the city may remove and dispose
of accumulations and apply the deposit to costs, including overhead
expenses, incurred by such removal.

Subsection 324.1.3 Return of Deposit. (Added)
The Fire Marshal will inspect sites as soon as possible after January
10 of each year. Permittees who have completed the site cleanup

will receive a rebate of the cleanup guarantee deposit.

Subsection 324.1.4 Liability. (Added)



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 10

13.20.170

Each permittee shall provide general liability insurance in the amount
of $100,000 for each person and $300,000 for each occurrence
against any claim for any damages caused in any manner from the
use of such lot or the keeping or sale of any Christmas trees therein.
A certificate of such insurance shall be filed with the Fire Marshal
showing the city as a named insured hereunder.

Section 325 USE OF EQUIPMENT
Section 325 Use of equipment (Added)

Except as otherwise provided in this section, no person shall use,
operate, or cause to be operated in, upon or adjoining any hazardous
fire area any internal combustion engine which uses hydrocarbon
fuels, unless the engine is equipped with a spark arrester as defined
in Section 202 maintained in effective working order, or the engine is
constructed, equipped and maintained for the prevention of fire.

Exceptions:

1. Engines used to provide motor power for trucks, truck tractors,
buses, and passenger vehicles, except motorcycles, are not
subject to this section if the exhaust system is equipped with a
muffler as defined in the Vehicle Code of the State of California.

2. Turbocharged engines are not subject to this section if all
exhausted gases pass through the rotating turbine wheel, there
is no exhaust bypass to the atmosphere, and the turbocharger
is in good mechanical condition

Section 325.1 Use of Equipment and Devices Generating Heat,
Sparks or Open Flames (Added)

Subsection 325.1 Equipment and devices generating heat, sparks
or open flames. During any time of the year within Wildfire Risk
Areas, within or immediately adjacent to any forest- or brush-covered
land or non-irrigated grass-covered land, no person shall use or
operate any welding equipment, cutting torches, tar pots, grinding
devices, or other tools or equipment that may produce a spark, fire, or
flame that could result in a wildfire without doing the following:

1. First clearing away all flammable material, including snags,
from the area around such operation for a distance of 30 feet or
other approved method to reduce fire spread into the wildlands.



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 11

13.20.180

13.20.190

If 30-foot clearing cannot be achieved, then an alternate method
shall be approved by the AHJ prior to work starting.

2. Maintain one serviceable round point shovel with an overall
length of not less than forty-six (46) inches and one backpack
pump water-type fire extinguisher fully equipped and ready for
use at the immediate area during the operation.

3. Stop work when winds are 8 MPH or greater during periods
when relative humidity is less than 25%, or a red flag condition
has been declared or public announcement is made, when an
official sign was caused to be posted by the fire code official, or
when such fires present a hazard as determined by the fire code
official.

4. Keep a cell phone nearby and call 911 immediate in case of
fire.

Subsection 325.2 Spark Arresters (Added)

325.2 Spark arresters. Spark arresters shall comply with Section
202, and when affixed to the exhaust system of engines or vehicles
subject to Section 325 shall not be placed or mounted in such a
manner as to allow flames or heat from the exhaust system to ignite
any flammable material.

SECTION 503 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
Subsection 503.1 Where Required. (Amended)

Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in
accordance with Sections 503.1.1 through 503.1.3 and Appendix D,
as amended.

SECTION 505 PREMISES IDENTIFICATION
Subsection 505.1 Address Numbers. (Amended)

New and existing buildings, including Accessory Dwelling Units
(ADU), shall have approved address numbers, building numbers or
approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly
legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property.
These numbers shall contrast with their background. Where
required by the fire code official, address numbers shall be provided
in additional approved locations to facilitate emergency response.



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 12

13.20.200

13.20.210

13.20.220

Address numbers shall be in accordance with Fullerton Fire
Department Standard No. 7 Premise Identification. Where access is
by means of a private road and the building cannot be viewed from
the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall be
used to identify the structure. Address numbers shall be maintained.
All Address identification shall be assigned and/or approved by the
City of Fullerton Public Works - Engineering Department.

SECTION 506 KEY BOXES
Subsection 506.1 Where Required. (Amended)

Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because
of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for
emergency Or non-emergency response purposes, the fire code
official is authorized to require a key box, lock or key switch to be
installed in an accessible location. The key box, switch, or lock shall
be of an approved type listed in accordance with UL 1037, and all
key boxes shall contain keys to gain necessary access a required by
the fire code official.

SECTION 507 FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES
Subsection 507.5.1 Where Required. (Amended)

Where a portion of the facility or building hereafter constructed or
moved into or within the jurisdiction is more than allowed in Appendix
C from a hydrant on a fire apparatus access road, as measured by
an approved route around the exterior of the facility or building, on-
site fire hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the
fire code official.

Subsection 507.5.1.1 Hydrant for standpipe systems.
(Amended)

Buildings equipped with a standpipe system installed in accordance
with Section 905 shall have a fire hydrant within 50 feet of the fire
department connections unless approved by the fire code official.

SECTION 510 EMERGENCY RESPONDER COMMUNICATION
COVERAGE

Section 510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new
buildings. (Amended)



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 13

13.20.230

All new buildings shall have approved radio coverage for emergency
responders within the building based upon the existing coverage
levels of the public safety communication systems of the jurisdiction,
measured at the exterior of the building. This section shall not require
improvement of the existing public safety communication systems.
The Emergency responder radio coverage system shall comply with
the following Fullerton Fire Department guidance document:

Information for Digital Antenna System (DAS)/ Bi-Directional
Amplification (BDA) Systems

Exceptions:

1. Where it is determined by the fire code official that the radio
coverage system is not needed.

2. In facilities where emergency responder radio coverage is
required and such systems, components or equipment could
have a negative impact on normal operations of the facility, the
fire code official shall have the authority to accept an
automatically activated emergency responder radio coverage
system.

CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
Subsection 903.2.8.2 Existing Group R buildings (Amended)

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed when
alterations to an existing building within a two year period removes
floor area or roof area assemblies of more than 50 percent of the
existing building.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not
be required for additions or alterations to existing buildings that are
not already provided with an automatic residential sprinkler system
and that do not include alterations within any two year period
involving the removal of floor area or roof area assemblies of more
than 50 percent of the total existing floor area of the building.

Subsection 903.2.8.2.1 Existing Group R buildings in Wildland-
Urban Interface Fire Areas. (Added)

An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed when
alterations to an existing building within a two year period removes



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 14

13.20.240

floor area or roof area assemblies of more than 33 percent of the
existing building.

Exception: An automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall not
be required for additions or alterations to existing buildings that are
not already provided with an automatic residential sprinkler system
and that do not include alterations within any two year period
involving the removal of floor area or roof area assemblies of more
than 33 percent of the total existing floor area of the building.

Subsection 903.3.1.3.1 NFPA 13D sprinkler systems alarms
(Added)

The homeowner shall have the choice of installing a local exterior
waterflow alarm or provide interconnection of the interior smoke
detectors to the waterflow switch.

Chapter 11, CONSTRUCTION REQUIRMENT FOR EXISTING
BUILDINGS

Adopt only those sections and subsections below:

1101.1, 1103.1-1103.3, 1103.7, 1103.7.3.1, 1103.7.8-1103.7.8.2,
1103.7.9-1103.7.9.10, 1103.8-1103.8.5.3, 1107, 1113, 1114, 1115,
and 1116.

Section 1103.2 Emergency Responder Radio Coverage in
Existing Buildings (Amended):

Existing buildings other than Group R-3 that do not have approved
radio coverage for emergency responders within the building, based
on existing coverage levels of the public safety communications
systems, shall be equipped with such coverage according to one of
the follow:

1. Where an existing wired communication system cannot be
repaired or is being replaced, or where not approved in accordance
with Section 510.1, Exception 1.

2. Within a time frame established by the adopting authority.

3. The Emergency responder radio coverage system shall comply
with the following Fullerton Fire Department guidance document:

Information for Digital Antenna System (DAS)/Bi-Directional
Amplification (BDA) Systems



Ordinance No. 3317
Page 15

Exception: Where it is determined by the fire code official that the
radio coverage is not needed.

13.20.250 Chapter 12, ENERGY SYSTEMS
Section 1205.2 Access and Pathways (Amended)

Exception 3. Building-Integrated Photovoltaic (BIPV) systems where
the BIPV systems are approved, integrated into the finished roof
surface and are listed in accordance with a national test standard
developed to address Section 690.12(B)(2) of the California
Electrical Code need to have smoke ventilation opportunity areas.
The removal or cutting away of portions of the BIPV system during
firefighting operations shall not expose a firefighter to electrical shock
hazard and smoke ventilation opportunity areas have been identified.

13.20.260 SECTION 4907 DEFENSIBLE SPACE
Section 4907.4 Brush Clearance in Protection Areas. (Added)

If Identified, each person or entity who owns, leases, controls,
operates, or maintains any parcel of land within or adjacent to the
protection area (as defined) shall comply with the Fullerton Fire
Department Standard “Brush Clearance on all Existing Properties
Located Within the Protection Area.”

Section 4907.5 Clearance of Brush and Vegetation from
Roadways. (Added)

The fire code official is authorized to require areas within 10’ of each
side of any portion of a roadway, highway or private street which are
improved, designed or ordinarily used for vehicular traffic to be
cleared of vegetation and other combustible growth. The fire code
official is authorized to enter upon private property to do so.

Exception: Single specimen trees, ornamental shrubs or cultivated
and irrigated ground cover such as grass, ivy, succulents, or similar
plants used as ground cover, provided that they do not form a means
of readily transmitting fire.

13.20.270 Section 4911 FUEL MODIFICATIONS REQUIREMENTS IN
PROTECTED AREAS

Section 4911 Fuel Modification Requirements in Protected
Areas (Added)



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 16

13.20.280

13.20.290

All new construction within the high or very high fire severity zones,
as identified by the California State Fire Marshal, shall comply with
the following:

1. The fuel modification plans shall comply with Fullerton Fire
Department Standard Fullerton Very High Fire Hazard Severity Zone
Requirements — Technical Design for New Construction Fuel
Modification Plans and Maintenance Program.

2. Preliminary fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and
approved by the fire code official concurrent with the submittal for
approval of any tentative map(s).

3. Final fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and approved
by the fire code official prior to the issuance of a grading permit.

4. The fuel modification plan may be altered if conditions change.
Any alterations to the fuel modification areas shall have prior
approval by the fire code official.

5. All elements of the fuel modification plan shall be maintained in
accordance with the approved plan and are subject to the
enforcement process outlined in the Fire Code.

SECTION 5601 EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS GENERAL
Section 5601.1.3.1 Seizure of Fireworks. (Added)

The fire code official shall have the authority to seize, take, and
remove all fireworks stored, sold, offered for sale, used or handled in
violation of the provisions of Chapter 6 of Title 19 of the California
Code of Regulations. Any seizure or removal pursuant to this section
shall be in compliance with all applicable statutory constitutional and
decisional law.

Section 5601.1.3.2 Explosives and blasting. (Added)

Explosives, including Safe and Sane Fireworks, shall not be
possessed, kept, stored, sold, offered for sale, given away, used,
discharged, transported or disposed of within wildland-urban
interface areas, or hazardous fire areas.

SECTION 5608 FIREWORKS DISPLAY

Section 5608.2 Firing. (Added)



Ordinance No. 3317

Page 17

13.20.300

SECTION 2.

SECTION 3.

All fireworks displays shall be electrically fired.
Section 5608.3 Application for Permit (Added)

A diagram of the grounds on which the display is to be held showing
the point at which the fireworks are to be discharged, the fallout area
based on 100 feet per inch of shell size, the location of all buildings,
roads, and other means of transportation, the lines behind which the
audience will be restrained, the location of all nearby trees, telegraph
or telephone line, or other overhead obstructions shall be provided
to Fullerton Fire Department.

APPENDIX D FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
D103 MINIMUM SPECIFICATIONS
D103.3 Turning Radius. (Amended)

The minimum turning radius shall be 28 feet inside/48 feet outside
or as determined by the fire code official.

If any section, subsection, phrase, or clause of this ordinance is held
unconstitutional for any reason, such decision will not affect the
validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. City Council
hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance and each
section, subsection, phrase or clause thereof irrespective of the fact
that any one or more sections, subsections, phrases or clauses may
be declared unconstitutional.

The City Clerk shall certify to the passage and adoption of this
ordinance and published in the manner required by law. This
ordinance shall become effective thirty days from and after its
passage.

ADOPTED BY THE FULLERTON CITY COUNCIL ON DECEMBER 20, 2022.

> —=——r

Fred Jung
Mayor



Ordinance No. 3317
Page 18

illiams, MMC
ity Clerk

/"
Date L ¢ &CES



City of Fullerton
ORDINANCE CERTIFICATION

STATE OF CALIFORNIA )
COUNTY OF ORANGE ) SS
CITY OF FULLERTON )

ORDINANCE NO. 3317

I, Lucinda Williams, City Clerk and ex-officio Clerk of the City Council of the City of Fullerton, California,
hereby certifies that the whole number of the members of the City Council of the City of Fullerton is five;
and that the above and foregoing Ordinance No. 3317 had first reading by title only, introduction and
further reading waived at the November 15, 2022 City Council regular meeting and was adopted at the
December 20, 2022 City Council regular meeting by the following vote:

COUNCIL MEMBER AYES: Jung, Whitaker, Charles, Dunlap, Zahra
COUNCIL MEMBER NOES: None
COUNCIL MEMBER ABSTAINED: None
COUNCIL MEMBER ABSENT: None

(X,
LucindadHams, MMC
City Clerk




	Ordinance 3316 - Amending Code Title 14 to Adopt 2022 CA Building Code
	Ordinance 3317 - Amending Code Title 13 to Adopt 2022 CA Fire Code



